
Coronavirus (Scotland) Act 2020 asp 7
SCHEDULE 4 – Justice
Document Generated: 2023-05-26

1

Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally enacted).

SCHEDULE 4
JUSTICE

PART 6

COMMUNITY ORDERS

Community payback orders: time limit for completion of unpaid work or other activity
13 (1) Section 227L of the Criminal Procedure (Scotland) Act 1995 (time limit for

completion of unpaid work or other activity) applies in accordance with the
modifications in this paragraph.

(2) Subsection (2)(a) has effect as if for “3 months” there were substituted “12 months”.

(3) Subsection (2)(b) has effect as if for “6 months” there were substituted “12 months”.


