
Changes to legislation: There are currently no known outstanding effects for the The Agriculture (Student
fees) (Amendment) Regulations (Northern Ireland) 2020 (revoked). (See end of Document for details)

STATUTORY RULES OF NORTHERN IRELAND

2020 No. 8

AGRICULTURE

The Agriculture (Student fees) (Amendment)
Regulations (Northern Ireland) 2020 (revoked)F1

Made       -      -      -      - 9th January 2020

Coming into operation 1st August 2020

THE AGRICULTURE (STUDENT FEES) (AMENDMENT)
REGULATIONS (NORTHERN IRELAND) 2020 (REVOKED)

1. Citation and commencement  
2. Amendment to the Agriculture (Student fees) Regulations (Northern

Ireland) 2007
 

3. In regulation 1(2) after the definition of “higher education” insert-...  
4. In regulation 4 (1) for “£1,690” substitute “£1,735”:  
5. After regulation 4(3) insert- (4) Subject to paragraph (5) and...  
6. In regulation 4(4) for “(4)” substitute “(6)”.  
7. In regulation 5(2) for “£825” substitute “£845”.  
8. Revocation  
  Signature  
  Explanatory Note  



Changes to legislation: 
There are currently no known outstanding effects for the The Agriculture (Student fees)
(Amendment) Regulations (Northern Ireland) 2020 (revoked).


