Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

SCOTTISH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

NN RN

2008 No. 137

LEGAL AID AND ADVICE

The Advice and Assistance (Financial
Conditions) (Scotland) Regulations 2008

Made - - - - 27th March 2008
Coming into force 7th April 2008

THE ADVICE AND ASSISTANCE (FINANCIAL
CONDITIONS) (SCOTLAND) REGULATIONS 2008

Citation, commencement and interpretation

Application

Amendment of the Legal Aid (Scotland) Act 1986

In section 8 of the Actfor “£1,502” substitute “£1,561”.

In section 11(2)(a) of the Actfor “£91” substitute “£95”.
Liability to pay fees or outlays under section 11(2) of the Act
(1) Where a solicitor has approved and proceeded to provide...
Revocation

Signature

Explanatory Note



