Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

SCOTTISH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2023 No. 300

The Public Procurement (Agreement on Government
Procurement) (Thresholds) (Miscellaneous
Amendments) (Scotland) Regulations 2023

Amendment of the Public Contracts (Scotland) Regulations 2015

2.—(1) The Public Contracts (Scotland) Regulations 2015 are amended as follows.
(2) Inregulation 5(1) (thresholds)—

(a) in sub-paragraph (a), for “£5,336,937” substitute “£5,372,609”,

(b) in sub-paragraph (b), for “£138,760 substitute “£139,688”,

(c) in sub-paragraph (c), for “£213,477” substitute “£214,904”.



