
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

SCOTTISH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2024 No. 40

The Education (Scotland) Act 1980
(Modification) Regulations 2024

Eligibility for free school meals

2. In section 53(7) of the Education (Scotland) Act 1980 (provision of school meals)—
(a) in paragraph (aa)(1), for “£8,717” substitute “£9,552”,
(b) in paragraph (c)(2), for “£726”, in both places where it appears, substitute “£796”.

(1) Section 53(7)(aa) was inserted by S.S.I. 2019/179 and last amended by S.S.I. 2023/37.
(2) Section 53(7)(c) was inserted by S.S.I. 2021/210 and last amended by S.S.I. 2023/37.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2019/179
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2023/37
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2021/210
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2023/37

