
Status: Point in time view as at 03/03/2015. This version of this provision has been superseded.
Changes to legislation: Local Government Act 2003, Section 107 is up to date with all changes known to be in

force on or before 28 September 2024. There are changes that may be brought into force at a future date. Changes
that have been made appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

Local Government Act 2003
2003 CHAPTER 26

PART 8

MISCELLANEOUS AND GENERAL

CHAPTER 1

MISCELLANEOUS

Audit Commission

107 Auditors' public interest reports: time allowed for consideration

(1) The Audit Commission Act 1998 (c. 18) is amended as follows.

(2) In section 11(4) (body subject to audit must consider section 8 report or section 11(3)
recommendation within four months of its being sent), for “four months” there is
substituted “ one month ”.

(3) In section 11(6) (auditor’s power to extend time limit), for “four months” there is
substituted “ one month ”.

(4) In section 11A(8) (Mayor and Assembly must consider section 8 report or
section 11(3) recommendation within four months of its being sent to the Greater
London Authority), for “four months” substitute “ one month ”.

(5) In section 11A(9) (auditor’s power to extend time limit), for “four months” there is
substituted “ one month ”.

Commencement Information
I1 S. 107 in force at 18.11.2003 by S.I. 2003/2938, art. 2(a) (with art. 8, Sch.)

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2003/26/section/107
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2003/2938
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2003/2938/article/2/a
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2003/2938/article/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2003/2938/schedule


2 Local Government Act 2003 (c. 26)
Document Generated: 2024-09-28

Status: 
Point in time view as at 03/03/2015. This version of this provision has been superseded.

Changes to legislation: 
Local Government Act 2003, Section 107 is up to date with all changes known to be in force on
or before 28 September 2024. There are changes that may be brought into force at a future date.
Changes that have been made appear in the content and are referenced with annotations.


