
Status: Point in time view as at 13/03/2014.
Changes to legislation: There are currently no known outstanding effects for the Electoral

Administration Act 2006, Cross Heading: Campaign expenditure. (See end of Document for details)

Electoral Administration Act 2006
2006 CHAPTER 22

PART 7

REGULATION OF PARTIES

Campaign expenditure

64 Campaign expenditure: standing for more than one party

(1) Schedule 9 to the 2000 Act (limits on campaign expenditure) is amended as follows.

(2) In paragraph 5 (general elections to Scottish Parliament) after sub-paragraph (2)
insert—

“(2A) Sub-paragraph (2B) applies to a registered party in a case where at the election
a candidate stands for election in any constituency in the name of that party
and one or more other registered parties.

(2B) In such a case, the amount applying to the party in respect of the constituency
under sub-paragraph (2)(a) shall, instead of being the amount specified in
that sub-paragraph, be that amount divided by the number of registered
parties in whose name the candidate stands for election as mentioned in sub-
paragraph (2A).”

(3) In paragraph 6 (ordinary elections to National Assembly for Wales) after sub-
paragraph (2) insert—

“(2A) Sub-paragraph (2B) applies to a registered party in a case where at the election
a candidate stands for election in any constituency in the name of that party
and one or more other registered parties.

(2B) In such a case, the amount applying to the party in respect of the constituency
under sub-paragraph (2)(a) shall, instead of being the amount specified in
that sub-paragraph, be that amount divided by the number of registered
parties in whose name the candidate stands for election as mentioned in sub-
paragraph (2A).”



2 Electoral Administration Act 2006 (c. 22)
Part 7 – Regulation of parties

Document Generated: 2024-08-20
Status: Point in time view as at 13/03/2014.

Changes to legislation: There are currently no known outstanding effects for the Electoral
Administration Act 2006, Cross Heading: Campaign expenditure. (See end of Document for details)

(4) In paragraph 7 (general elections to Northern Ireland Assembly) after sub-
paragraph (2) insert—

“(2A) Sub-paragraph (2B) applies to a registered party in a case where at the election
a candidate stands for election in any constituency in the name of that party
and one or more other registered parties.

(2B) In such a case, the amount applying to the party in respect of the constituency
under sub-paragraph (2) shall, instead of being the amount specified in
that sub-paragraph, be that amount divided by the number of registered
parties in whose name the candidate stands for election as mentioned in sub-
paragraph (2A).”

Commencement Information
I1 S. 64 wholly in force at 11.9.2006, see s. 77(2)-(4) and S.I. 2006/1972, art. 3, Sch. 1 para. 21 (subject

to transitional provisions in Sch. 2)

65 Time limit for claims in respect of campaign expenditure

(1) In section 77 of the 2000 Act (restriction on making claims in respect of campaign
expenditure)—

(a) in subsection (1), for “21 days” substitute “ 30 days ”;
(b) in subsection (2), for “42 days” substitute “ 60 days ”.

(2) In section 92 of that Act (restriction on making claims in respect of certain expenditure
by third parties)—

(a) in subsection (1), for “21 days” substitute “ 30 days ”;
(b) in subsection (2), for “42 days” substitute “ 60 days ”.

(3) In section 115 of that Act (restriction on making claims in respect of referendum
expenditure)—

(a) in subsection (1), for “21 days” substitute “ 30 days ”;
(b) in subsection (2), for “42 days” substitute “ 60 days ”.

Commencement Information
I2 S. 65 wholly in force at 11.9.2006, see s. 77(2)-(4) and S.I. 2006/1972, art. 3, Sch. 1 para. 22 (subject

to transitional provisions in Sch. 2)

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2006/22/section/64
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2006/22/section/77/2
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2006/1972
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2006/1972/article/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2006/1972/schedule/1/paragraph/21
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2006/1972/schedule/2
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2006/22/section/65
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2006/22/section/77/2
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2006/1972
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2006/1972/article/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2006/1972/schedule/1/paragraph/22
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2006/1972/schedule/2


Electoral Administration Act 2006 (c. 22)
Document Generated: 2024-08-20

3

Status: 
Point in time view as at 13/03/2014.

Changes to legislation: 
There are currently no known outstanding effects for the Electoral Administration Act 2006,
Cross Heading: Campaign expenditure.


