Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2003 No. 2211

The Council Tax (Administration and Enforcement)
(Amendment) (No. 2) (England) Regulations 2003

Charges connected with distress

4. In Schedule 5
(a) in column (2) of the Table to paragraph 1—

(i) in relation to head A (visit where no levy is made), for “£20.00” substitute “£22.50”,
and for “£15.00” substitute “£16.50”;

(i1) in relation to head E (possession of goods), for “£12.50” substitute “£14.00” and for
“£10.00” substitute “£11.00”; and

(iii) in relation to head H (prior payment etc.), for “£20.00” substitute “£22.50”; and
(b) in sub-paragraph (1) of paragraph 2 (amounts in respect of levy)—
(1) in paragraph (a), for “£20” substitute “£22.50”; and
(i1) in paragraph (b), for “20 per cent” substitute “22.5 per cent”.

[ODPM 2796]



