Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2016 No. 621

The Registrar of Companies (Fees)
(Amendment) Regulations 2016

Amendment to the Registrar of Companies (Fees) (Limited Partnerships and Newspaper
Proprietors) Regulations 2009

18.—(1) Schedule 2 is amended as follows.

(2) In paragraph 4(b)(i) in the second column (amount of fee) for “£20.00” substitute “£15.00”.
(3) In paragraph 4(b)(ii) in the second column (amount of fee) for “£60.00” substitute “£50.00”.
(4) In paragraph 4(c)(i) in the second column (amount of fee) for “£20.00” substitute “£15.00”.
(5) In paragraph 4(c)(ii) in the second column (amount of fee) for “£60.00” substitute “£50.00”.
(6) In paragraph 5(e)(i) in the second column (amount of fee) for “£20.00” substitute “£15.00”.
(7) Inparagraph 5(e)(iii) in the second column (amount of fee) for “£60.00” substitute “£50.00”.
(8) In paragraph 5(f)(i) in the second column (amount of fee) for “£20.00” substitute “£15.00”.
(9) In paragraph 5(f)(iii) in the second column (amount of fee) for “£60.00 substitute “£50.00”.
(10) In paragraph 5(g)(i) in the second column (amount of fee) for “£20.00” substitute “£15.00”.
(11) In paragraph 5(g)(ii) in the second column (amount of fee) for “£60.00” substitute “£50.00”.
(12) In paragraph 5(h)(i) in the second column (amount of fee) for “£20.00” substitute “£15.00”.
(13) Inparagraph 5(h)(ii) in the second column (amount of fee) for “£60.00” substitute “£50.00”.
(14) In paragraph 6(c)(i) in the second column (amount of fee) for “£20.00” substitute “£15.00”.
(15) Inparagraph 6(c)(ii) in the second column (amount of fee) for “£60.00” substitute “£50.00”.
(16) In paragraph 6(d)(i) in the second column (amount of fee) for “£20.00” substitute “£15.00”.
(17) In paragraph 6(d)(ii) in the second column (amount of fee) for “£60.00” substitute “£50.00”.
(18) In paragraph 6(e)(i) in the second column (amount of fee) for “£20.00” substitute “£15.00”.
(19) In paragraph 6(e)(ii) in the second column (amount of fee) for “£60.00” substitute “£50.00”.
(20) In paragraph 6(f)(i) in the second column (amount of fee) for “£20.00” substitute “£15.00”.
(21) In paragraph 6(f)(ii) in the second column (amount of fee) for “£60.00” substitute “£50.00”.



