Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

WELSH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2022 No. 79

The Education (Student Finance) (Miscellaneous
Amendments) (Wales) Regulations 2022

PART 6
Amendments to the Education (Student Support) (Wales) Regulations 2018

CHAPTER 3

Amendments relating to financial support

Amendments to regulation S5 (amount of maintenance loan: full-time students)

42. Inregulation 55, Table 7 is amended as follows—

(a) in column 1, after “Beginning on or after 1 September 2021” insert “but before 1
September 2022”;

(b) at the end of the Table add the following entry—

“Beginning on Category 1 Living at home £8,095
or  after 1 .. L
September 2022 Living away from home, studying in London £12,375
Living away from home, studying elsewhere £9,710
Category 2 Living at home £4,045

Living away from home, studying in London £6,185

Living away from home, studying elsewhere £4,855”

Amendments to regulation 56 (amount of maintenance loan: full-time students who qualify
for special support payment)

43. Inregulation 56—
(a) Table 8 is amended as follows—

(1) in column 1, after “Beginning on or after 1 September 2021” insert “but before 1
September 2022”;

(i) at the end of the Table add the following entry—

“Beginning on or after 1 Living at home £9,095

September 2022 Living away from home, studying in London £13,375

Living away from home, studying elsewhere £10,710”

(b) Table 8A is amended as follows—



Document Generated: 2023-08-18
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

(i) in column 1, after “Beginning on or after 1 September 2021” insert “but before 1
September 2022”;

(i1) at the end of the Table add the following entry—

“Beginning on or after 1 Living at home £4,045

September 2022 Living away from home, studying in London £6,185

Living away from home, studying elsewhere £4,855”

Amendments to regulation 57 (increased maintenance loan for full-time students in extended
years)

44. Inregulation 57, Table 9 is amended as follows—

(a) in column 1, after “Beginning on or after 1 September 2021” insert “but before 1
September 2022”;

(b) at the end of the Table add the following entry—

“Beginning on or after 1 Living at home £91

September 2022 Living away from home, studying in London £176

Living away from home, studying elsewhere  £138”

Amendments to regulation 58 (amount of maintenance loan: part-time students)

45. In regulation 58, Table 10 is amended as follows—

(a) in column 1, after “Beginning on or after 1 September 2021” insert “but before 1
September 2022”;

(b) at the end of the Table add the following entry—

“Beginning on or after 1 £6,905 multiplied by the intensity of study”
September 2022

Amendments to regulation 58A (amount of maintenance loan: part-time students who
qualify for special support payment)

46. In regulation 58A, Table 10A is amended as follows—

(a) in column 1, after “Beginning on or after 1 September 2021” insert “but before 1
September 2022”;

(b) at the end of the Table add the following entry—

“Beginning on or after 1 £7,905 multiplied by the intensity of study”
September 2022

Amendment to regulation 63 (amount of disabled student’s grant)

47. Inregulation 63(2), in Case 1, for “£31,831” substitute “£32,546”.



Document Generated: 2023-08-18

Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

Amendment to regulation 72 (maximum amount of adult dependants grant)

48. In regulation 72, Table 11 is amended as follows—

(a) in column 1, after “Beginning on or after 1 September 2021” insert “but before 1
September 2022”;

(b) at the end of the Table add the following entry—

“Beginning on or after 1 September 2022 £3,262”

Amendments to regulation 74 (maximum amount of parents’ learning grant)

49. In regulation 74, Table 12 is amended as follows—

(a) in column 1, after “Beginning on or after 1 September 2021 insert “but before 1
September 2022”;

(b) at the end of the Table add the following entry—

“Beginning on or after 1 September 2022 £1,862”

Amendments to regulation 76 (maximum amount of childcare grant)

50. In regulation 76—
(a) Table 13 is amended as follows—

(1) in column 1, after “Beginning on or after 1 September 2021 insert “but before 1
September 2022”;

(i) at the end of the Table add the following entry—

“Beginning on or after 1 One dependent child £184

September 2022 More than one dependent £315”

child

(b) in paragraph (4), for “£138.31” substitute “£141”.

Amendment to Schedule 4 (disabled postgraduate student’s grant)
51. In Schedule 4, in paragraph 20(2), in Case 1, for “£31,831” substitute “£32,546”.



