Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2005 No. 184

LEGAL SERVICES COMMISSION,
ENGLAND AND WALES

The Community Legal Service (Funding) (Counsel

in Family Proceedings) (Amendment) Order 2005

Made - - - - 31st January 2005
Laid before Parliament 2nd February 2005
Coming into force 28th February 2005

THE COMMUNITY LEGAL SERVICE FUNDING%&():OUNSEL

IN FAMILY PROCEEDINGS) (AMENDMENT) O

—_—

ER 2005

Citation, commencement and interpretation

Transitional provisions

Amendment to the Community Legal Service (Funding) (Counsel in Family
Proceedings) Order 2001

After article 2 insert— Function F1 (1) Subject to paragraph (2), function
F1 means all work—...

In article 4— (a) in paragraph (2), for “(3)” substitute...

In article 5(1)(c) after “payment” insert “(“CBP”)”.

In article 6(1) for “Only one base fee” substitute “A...

(1) After article 9(1)(c) insert— (ca) representation of a person...

In article 9(2)— (a) for “(c)” substitute “(cb)(i)”;

For article 9(4) substitute— (4) In relation to functions F2,...

In article 9(5)— (a) for “Subject to paragraph (8)” substitute...

Omit article 9(7) and (8).

In article 10— (a) for “£150” substitute “£287.50”; and

In article I0A— (a) for “£206.25” substitute “£162.50”; and

After article 10A insert— Payments for enforcement procedures and
contested...

After article 12(1) insert— (1A) In paragraph (1), reference to...

For article 17(6) substitute— (6) Counsel shall submit his claim...
For Schedule 1, substitute the new Schedule 1 set out...

Signature



Document Generated: 2023-08-18
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

SCHEDULE —

Explanatory Note



