
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

WELSH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2007 No. 2312 (W.183)

EDUCATION, WALES

The Assembly Learning Grants and Loans (Higher
Education) (Wales) (Amendment) Regulations 2007

Made       -      -      -      - 4 August 2007
Laid before the National
Assembly for Wales 7 August 2007

Coming into force 31 August 2007

THE ASSEMBLY LEARNING GRANTS AND LOANS (HIGHER
EDUCATION) (WALES) (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2007

PART 1

GENERAL

1. Title, commencement and application  
2. Interpretation  
3. Amendment to the 2006 Regulations and the 2007 Regulations  
4. The 2007 Regulations are amended in accordance with Part 3....  

PART 2

AMENDMENTS TO THE 2006 REGULATIONS

5. In regulation 2(1)— (a) in the appropriate place in the...  
6. After regulation 2(1), insert— (1A) the Secretary of State may...  
7. In regulation 7(5), after “attended”, insert “or, in the case...  
8. For regulation 8(2) substitute— (2) The grounds for transfer are...  
9. After regulation 10(2)(e), insert— (ea) the applicant is a person...  

10. After regulation 11A(2) insert — (3) A student to whom...  
11. After regulation 11C(e), insert— (ea) the student becomes the

child...
 

12. After regulation 18(8)(d), insert— (da) the student becomes the
child...

 

13. After regulation 18(8), insert— (9) A student to whom this...  
14. After regulation 31(3), insert— (4) A student to whom this...  
15. In regulation 32 for “an accelerated course” in each place...  
16. In regulation 33 for “an accelerated course” in each place...  



Document Generated: 2023-08-28
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

17. In regulation 35 for “an accelerated course” in each place...  
18. For regulation 37, substitute— (1) Subject to regulation 39, the...  
19. After regulation 39(2)(d) insert— (da) the student becomes the

child...
 

20. After regulation 46(4)(e), insert— (f) GFF is the amount, if...  
21. In regulation 46(6) for “an accelerated course”, substitute “an

intensive...
 

22. In regulation 50, after paragraph 14(f), insert—  
23. After regulation 55(3)(b), insert— (ba) the applicant is a person...  
24. After regulation 62(12), insert— (13) Where one of the events...  
25. In Schedule 1— (a) for paragraph 1(4), substitute—  
26. After paragraph 8(d) of Schedule 3A, insert-  

PART 3

AMENDMENTS TO THE 2007 REGULATIONS

27. In regulation 2(1)— (a) in the appropriate place in the...  
28. After regulation 2 (1), insert— (1A) The Secretary of State...  
29. Insert after paragraph (18) of regulation 6, the following

paragraphs...
 

30. In paragraphs (1) and (2) of regulation 7, omit the...  
31. In regulation 7, omit paragraphs (6) and (7).  
32. For regulation 8(2) substitute— (2) The grounds for transfer are...  
33. After regulation 10(2)(c), insert— (ca) the applicant is a person...  
34. After regulation 12(3) insert — (4) A student to whom...  
35. After regulation 14(e), insert— (ea) the student becomes the child...  
36. In regulation 15(1), after the words “subject to”, insert the...  
37. After regulation 15(3), insert— (4) A continuing student does not...  
38. After regulation 16(5), for “£4,445”, substitute “£4,455.”  
39. In regulation 18(1), after the words “Subject to paragraph (2)”...  
40. In regulation 20(1), omit the words, “Subject to paragraph (7)”....  
41. After regulation 23(11)(d), insert— (da) the student becomes the

child...
 

42. After regulation 23(11), insert— (12) A student to whom this...  
43. In regulation 37(4)(c), for “£615” substitute “£610”.  
44. After regulation 38(4), insert— (5) A student to whom this...  
45. In regulation 39 for “an accelerated course” in each place...  
46. In regulation 40 for “an accelerated course” in each place...  
47. In regulation 42 for “an accelerated course” in each place...  
48. For regulation 44 substitute— (1) Subject to regulation 46, the...  
49. After regulation 46(2)(d), insert— (da) the student becomes the

child...
 

50. After regulation 54(4)(e), insert— (f) GFF is the amount, if...  
51. In regulation 54(6) for “an accelerated course”, substitute “an

intensive...
 

52. In regulation 62, after paragraph 15(f), insert—  
53. In regulation 65(1)(b), for “£1,000” substitute “£1,025”.  
54. In regulation 65(5)(g), 65(5)(h) and 65(5)(i), wherever the figure

“£26,260”...
 

55. In regulation 65(6)(a), for the figures, “£,15.92”, “£12.79,” and
“£9.94”...

 

56. After regulation 67(4)(a), insert— (aa) the applicant is a person...  



Document Generated: 2023-08-28
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

57. After regulation 74(17)(d), insert— (da) the student becomes the
child...

 

58. For sub-paragraphs (a) and (b) of regulation 75(3), substitute—  
59. In regulation 76(1), omit the words, “regulations 4 and 6”...  
60. For regulation 76(7), substitute— (7) Where the period of

eligibility...
 

61. After regulation 76(7), insert— (8) Where the eligible postgraduate
student...

 

62. In Schedule 1— (a) for paragraph 1(3), substitute—  
63. After paragraph 5(d) of Schedule 4, insert—  

  Signature  
  Explanatory Note  


