
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally enacted).

2022 CHAPTER 20

Increase in time limits for requirements relating to tenancy deposits

5. In Article 5B of the 2006 Order (requirements relating to tenancy deposits)
—

(a) in paragraph (3), for “14 days” substitute “28 days”;
(b) in paragraph (6)(b), for “28 days” substitute “35 days”.

1


