Draft Legislation: This is a draft item of legislation. This draft has since been made as a Northern Ireland Statutory Rule: The
Energy Performance of Buildings (Certificates and Inspections) (Amendment) Regulations (Northern Ireland) 2021 No. 72

DRAFT STATUTORY RULES OF NORTHERN IRELAND

2021 No.

The Energy Performance of Buildings (Certificates and
Inspections) (Amendment) Regulations (Northern Ireland) 2021

Amendment of regulation 25A
3. Inregulation 25A(Fees for entering data onto the register)—
(a) in paragraph (a), for “£1.86” substitute “£1.64”; and
(b) in paragraph (a), for “£9.84” substitute “£1.89”



