
Changes to legislation: There are currently no known outstanding effects for the The Charities
(Northern Ireland) Order 1987, Amendments of the Act of 1964. (See end of Document for details)

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

1987 No. 2048

The Charities (Northern Ireland) Order 1987

Amendments of the Act of 1964

Increase and variation of certain financial limits

6.—(1)  In section 13(1) of the Act of 1964 (power of Department to make a cy-près scheme in
certain circumstances if the aggregate value of the property to be comprised in the scheme does not
exceed £5,000), for the words “five thousand pounds” there shall be substituted “ £50,000 ”.

(2)  In section 14(1) of that Act (power of personal representatives to transfer property, not
exceeding £250 in value, which is devised or bequeathed to a misdescribed charitable institution),
for the words “two hundred and fifty pounds” there shall be substituted “ £2,500 ”.

(3)  In section 24(1) of that Act (power of Department to make a scheme for the application for
charitable purposes of property, not exceeding £5,000 in value, given so that it could be used for
charitable or non-charitable purposes) for the words “five thousand pounds” there shall be substituted
“ £50,000 ”.

(4)  After section 31 of that Act there shall be inserted the following section—

“Variation of financial limits.

31A. The Department may by order subject to affirmative resolution amend sections 13(1),
14(1) and 24(1) by substituting for any sum specified in any of those provisions such other
sum as the Department considers appropriate.”.

Value of property for purposes of the Act of 1964

7. For section 32 of the Act of 1964 (calculation of value of land and periodical payments charged
on or issuing out of land) there shall be substituted the following section—

“Value of land, etc., for purposes of Act.

32.—(1)  In determining the value of any property for the purposes of this Act, the
value of any land and of any periodical payment charged on or issuing out of land shall be
taken to be such amount as may be specified in a certificate given by or on behalf of the
Commissioner of Valuation.

(2)  Any document purporting to be a certificate given by or on behalf of the
Commissioner of Valuation for the purposes of subsection (1) shall be received in evidence
and, until the contrary is proved, be deemed to be duly given.”.

Application to this Order of certain provisions of the Act of 1964

8. Sections 34 to 36 of the Act of 1964 (annual report by Department, interpretation, and saving
for functions of Attorney-General) shall apply to this Order and accordingly—

(a) in section 34, at the end of subsection (1) there shall be added the words “and the Charities
(Northern Ireland) Order 1987”;



Document Generated: 2024-07-06
Changes to legislation: There are currently no known outstanding effects for the The Charities

(Northern Ireland) Order 1987, Amendments of the Act of 1964. (See end of Document for details)

(b) in section 35, after the words “this Act” there shall be inserted the words “ and the Charities
(Northern Ireland) Order 1987 ”;

(c) in section 36, after the words “in this Act” there shall be inserted the words “ or the
Charities (Northern Ireland) Order 1987 ”.

2



Changes to legislation: 
There are currently no known outstanding effects for the The Charities (Northern Ireland) Order
1987, Amendments of the Act of 1964.


