
No. 318 Roai Traffic and Vehicles 

1976 No. 318 

, RO~]l TRAFFIC AND VEIDCLES 

Motor Cars (Driving InstrUction) (Amendment) Regulations 
(NortJIel':tl Ireland) 1976' 

Made 

Coming into, Qperation 

27th October 1976 

1st December 1976 

1535 

The Department of the Environment for Northern Ireland in .exercise of 
the powers conferred by sections 117, 117C and 189 of the Road Traffic ~ct 
(Northern Ireland) 1970(a) and now vested in it(b) and of every power en
abling it in that behalf hereby makes the folloWing Regulations: 

Citation andcommencem(mt 
1. These Regulations may be cited as the Motor Cars (Driving Instruction) 

(Amendment) Regul~tions (Northern Ireland) 1976 and shall come into opera
tion on 1st December 1976. 

Regulations amended 
2. The Motor Cars (Drivi~g Instt:uctiop.) Regulations (Northern Ireland) 

'1974(c) shall be amended as follows: 
In regulation 18-
(a) in paragraph '(1) fo;t: "£5" there shall be substituted "£15"; 
(b) in paragraph (2) for "£10" there shall be substituted "£25"; 
(c) in paragrap:h (3) for "£15" there shall be substituted "£25"; 
(d) in paragraph (4) for "£15" there shall be ,substituted "£25"; 
(e) in paragraph (5) for "£15" there shall be substituted "£25"; and 
(f) in paragraph (6) for "£1" there 'shall be sUlbstit4ted "£15" .. 

Sealed with the Official Seal of' the Department of the Eitvironment for 
Northern Ireland on 27th October 1976. 

(L.S.) S. D. Palmer 
Assistant Secretary 

l'heDepartment(d) of Fina,nce 4ereby approves of regulation 2. 

Sealed with the Official Seal of the Department of Finance for Northept 
Ireland on 27th October 1976. ' 

1. Murray 

(a) 1970 c. 2 (N.I.) as. amended ~y S.l. 1913/1229 (N.J. 17). Art. 8. 
(b) S.R. & O. (N.I.) 1973 No. 504, Art. 5(b) (II, p .. 2992). ' 

, (c) SiR, 1974 No. 109 (1, p. 354). ' , 
(d) Formerl:y Ministry: see 1973 c. 36 Soh. 5 para. 8(1). 

Assistant Secretary 



.1536 Road Traffic and Vehicles No. 318 

EXPLANATORY NOTE 

(This note is not part 'of the regulations but is intended to indicate 
their general purport.) 

These regulations amend the Motor Cars (Driving Instruction) Regu
. lations (Northern Ireland) 1974 by increasing the fees for: 

(a) the written part of the examination of ability to give instruction from 
£5 to £15; . 

(b) the practical part of the examination of ability to give instruction 
from £10 to £25; 

(c) an application for retention on the Register from £15 to £25; 
(d) an application for entry on the Register by a person on the corre

sponding Register in Great Britain from £15 to £25; 
(e) an application for re-entry on the Register in the circumstances des

cribed in regulation 18(5) of .the Regulations of 1974 from £15 to £25; 
and 

(f) an. application for a licence to give instruction from £1 to £15. 

1976 No. 319 

. As this Order has been classified as local it is not printed at length in this 
volume. A summary is given in the List of Statutory Rules of a Local Character 
under the heading ROAD TRAFFIC AND VEHICLES. 


	0001
	0002



