
No. 14 Road and Railway Transport 

1985 No. 14 

ROAD AND RAILWAY TRANSPORT 

The Road Transport Licensing (Authorisation ofInternational Journeys) 
(Fees) (Amendment) Regulations (Northern Ireland). 1985 

Made 

Coming into operation 

30th January 1985 

1 st April 1985 

49 

The Department of the Environment in exercise of the powers conferred on it by 
section 56( 1) and (5) of the Finance Act 1973(a) and of all other powers enabling it in 
.that behalf and with the consent of the Department of Finance and Personnel(b) 
. hereby makes the following regulations: 

Citation and commencement 
1. These regulations may be cited as the Road Transport Licensing (Authorisation 

ofInternational Journeys) (Fees) (Amendment) Regulations (Northern Ireland) 1985 
and shall come into operation on 1st April 1985. 

Amendments 
2. In regulation 4 of the Road Transport Licensing (Authorisation of International 

Journeys) (Fees) Regulations (Northern Ireland) 1984(c)-
(a) in paragraph (a) for the words "£39" substitute the words "£50"; and 
(b) in. paragraph (b) for the words "£3·25" substitute the words "£4·20". 

Sealed with the Official Seal of the Department of the Environment on 30th 
January 1985. 

(L.s.) J. M. [rvine 
Assistant Secretary 

The Department of Finance and Personnel hereby consents to regulation 2. 

Sealed with the Official Seal of the Department of Finance and Personnel on 30th 
January 1985. 

(L.s.) D. W. Alexander 

(a) 1973 c. 51 
(b) Formerly the Department of Finance. See S.l. 1982/338 (N.!. 6) Art. 3 
(c) S.R. 1984 No. 32 

Assistant Secretary 



50 Road and Railway Transport 

EXPLANATORY NOTE 

(This note is not part of the Regulations.) 

No. 14 

These regulations amend the Road Transport Licensing (Authorisation of 
International Journeys) (Fees) Regulations (Northern Ireland) 1984 by increasing the 
fees for period permit.s (permits. allowing Northern Ireland road. freight operators to 
carry goods for reward from Northern Ireland to the Republic ofIrelaJ?d an4 from the 
Republic of Ireland to Northern Ireland): 

(a) from £39 to £50 for a permit which is valid for one year; and 
(b) from £3 ·25 to £4·20 for eacb month, or part thereof for a permit wbich is valid 

fO,r less than one year. 

. i 
i 


	00001
	00002



