
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY RULES OF NORTHERN IRELAND

1994 No. 193

The Public Health (Metrication)
Regulations (Northern Ireland) 1994

Amendment of the Public Health (Ireland) Act 1878

3. The Public Health (Ireland) Act 1878(1) shall be amended as follows—
(a) in section 25(2) (power of district council to enforce drainage of undrained houses) for

“one hundred feet” on both occasions where it occurs substitute “30.5 metres”;
(b) in section 27(2) (penalty on braiding house without drains in any district) for “one hundred

feet” substitute “30.5 metres”; and
(c) in Schedule C, Form E for “one hundred feet” substitute “30.5 metres”.

(1) 1878 c. 52
(2) Sections 25 and 27 were amended by S.R. & O. (N.I.) 1973 No. 285
(2) Sections 25 and 27 were amended by S.R. & O. (N.I.) 1973 No. 285

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1878/52
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisro/1973/285
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisro/1973/285

