
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY RULES OF NORTHERN IRELAND

1997 No. 497

Court Funds (Amendment No. 3) Rules (Northern Ireland) 1997

Prescribed rates of interest

2. in Rule 32A of the Court Funds Rules (Northern Ireland) 1979(1)—
(a) In paragraph (2) for the words “4% per annum” substitute the words “4.5% per annum.”;
(b) in paragraph (3) for the words “5% per annum” substitute the words “6% per annum.”.

(1) S.R. 1979 No.105 as amended by S.R. 1997 No. 166 and S.R. 1997 No. 295

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/1979/105
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/1997/166
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/1997/295

