
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY RULES OF NORTHERN IRELAND

1998 No. 94

Charges for Drugs and Appliances (Amendment)
Regulations (Northern Ireland) 1998

Amendment of regulation 3 of the principal Regulations

3. In regulation 3 (supply of drugs and appliances by chemists)—
(a) in paragraphs (1)(a), (b) and (3) for “£5·65” there shall be substituted “£5·80”;
(b) in paragraph (1)(a) for “£11·30” there shall be substituted “£11·60”; and
(c) for paragraph (6) there shall be substituted the following paragraph—

“(6)  Any sum which would otherwise be payable by the Agency to a doctor in respect of
provision by him of pharmaceutical services shall be reduced by the amount of any charges
which are required to be made and recovered by preceding provisions of this regulation.”.


