Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY RULES OF NORTHERN IRELAND

1999 No. 50

The Social Security Benefits Up-
rating Order (Northern Ireland) 1999

Part 111
Family Credit, Disability Working Allowance, Income Support and Housing Benefit

Disability working allowance

17. In the Disability Working Allowance (General) Regulations (Northern Ireland) 1992(1)—

(a) inregulation 51(4) (determination of appropriate maximum disability working allowance)
the capital sum prescribed is £3,000;

(b) inregulation 51(4), (5) and (6) the amount specified for the allowance in respect of a child
or young person is nil;

(c) inregulation 52(1) (applicable amount)—
(i) in sub-paragraph (a) for “£59-25” there shall be substituted “£60-50”, and
(i1) in sub-paragraph (b) for “£79-00” there shall be substituted “£80-65”; and

(d) in Schedule 5 (determination of appropriate maximum disability working allowance) the
sums prescribed shall be as set out in Schedule 3 to this Order.

(1) S.R. 1992 No. 78; relevant amending provisions are S.R. 1993 No. 373, S.R. 1995 Nos. 67 and 223, S.R. 1996 No. 476, S.R.
1997 No. 152 and S.R. 1998 No. 59


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/1992/78
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/1993/373
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/1995/67
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/1995/223
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/1996/476
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/1997/152
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/1997/152
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/1998/59

