
STATUTORY RULES OF NORTHERN IRELAND

2000 No. 298

AGRICULTURE

Marketing of Potatoes (Amendment) Regulations
(Northern Ireland) 2000

Made . . . . . 12th October 2000

Coming into operation . . 13th November 2000

The Department of Agriculture and Rural Development(a), in exercise of
the powers conferred on it by sections 3(3), 7(2) and 11(1) of the Marketing
of Potatoes Act (Northern Ireland) 1964(b) and of every other power enabling
it in that behalf, and with the approval of the Department of Finance and
Personnel(c), hereby makes the following Regulations:—

Citation and commencement
1. These Regulations may be cited as the Marketing of Potatoes

(Amendment) Regulations (Northern Ireland) 2000 and shall come into
operation on 13th November 2000.

Amendment of the Marketing of Potatoes Regulations (Northern Ireland) 1989
2. The Marketing of Potatoes Regulations (Northern Ireland) 1989(d)

shall be amended as follows:—
(a) In paragraph (1) of regulation 7 (Fees for the inspection of ware

potatoes sent out of Northern Ireland) for “£3·35” there shall be
substituted “£3·40”;

(b) In regulation 8 (Fees for the examination of ware potatoes for sale in
Northern Ireland) for “£3·35” there shall be substituted “£3·40”.

Revocation
3. The Marketing of Potatoes (Amendment) Regulations (Northern

Ireland) 1994(e) are hereby revoked.

Sealed with the Official Seal of the Department of Agriculture and Rural
Development on 12th October 2000.

(L.S.) R. S. Johnston
Senior Officer of the Department of
Agriculture and Rural Development

(a) Formerly the Department of Agriculture for Northern Ireland. See Art. 3(4) of the Departments
(Northern Ireland) Order 1999 (S.I. 1999/283 (N.I. 1))

(b) 1964 c. 8 (N.I.) as amended by S.I. 1984/702 (N.I. 2) Art. 12(4)
(c) Formerly the Department of Finance: See S.I. 1982/338 (N.I. 6), Art. 3
(d) S.R. 1989 No. 221
(e) S.R. 1994 No. 385



The Department of Finance and Personnel hereby approves the foregoing
Regulations.

Sealed with the Official Seal of the Department of Finance and Personnel
on 12th October 2000.

(L.S.) D. Sterling
Senior Officer of the Department of

Finance and Personnel

2



EXPLANATORY NOTE

(This note is not part of the Regulations.)

These Regulations increase the fee payable for the inspection or
examination of ware potatoes from £3·35 per tonne or part of a tonne to £3·40
per tonne or part of a tonne.

3

£1·75

Published by The Stationery Office Limited

Printed in the UK by The

Stationery Office Limited

under the authority and

superintendence of Carol

Tullo, Controller of

Her Majesty’s Stationery

Office being the Government 

Printer for Northern Ireland and

the Officer appointed to print the

Acts of the Northern Ireland Assembly

Dd. 602407. C4. 10/00. Gp. 130. 14567.

ISBN 0-3379377-1-0


