
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY RULES OF NORTHERN IRELAND

2000 No. 38

The Social Security Benefits Up-
rating Order (Northern Ireland) 2000

Part II
Social Security Benefits and Pensions

Child benefit

13. In regulation 2(1) of the Child Benefit and Social Security (Fixing and Adjustment of Rates)
Regulations (Northern Ireland) 1976(1) (weekly rates of child benefit)—

(a) in sub-paragraph (a)(i) for “£14·40” there shall be substituted “£15·00”;
(b) in sub-paragraph (a)(ii) for “£17·10” there shall be substituted “£17·55”; and
(c) in sub-paragraph (b) for “£9·60” there shall be substituted “£10·00”.

(1) S.R. 1976 No. 223; relevant amending provisions are S.R. 1977 No. 248, S.R. 1991 No. 82, S.R. 1996 No. 288, S.R. 1998
No. 239 and S.R. 1999 No. 50

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/1976/223
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/1977/248
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/1991/82
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/1996/288
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/1998/239
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/1998/239
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/1999/50

