Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY RULES OF NORTHERN IRELAND

2001 No. 41

The Social Security Benefits Up-
rating Order (Northern Ireland) 2001

Part IV

Jobseeker’s Allowance

Age-related amounts of contribution-based jobseeker’s allowance

20. In regulation 79(1) of the Jobseeker’s Allowance Regulations (weekly amounts of
contribution-based jobseeker’s allowance)—

(a) in sub-paragraph (a) for “£31-45” there shall be substituted “£31-95”;
(b) in sub-paragraph (b) for “£41-35” there shall be substituted “£42-00’; and
(c) in sub-paragraph (c) for “£52-20” there shall be substituted “£53-05”.



