
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY RULES OF NORTHERN IRELAND

2001 No. 414

Gaming (Variation of Monetary
Limits) Order (Northern Ireland) 2001

Conditions governing gaming for prizes on bingo club premises

4. In Article 77(1) of the 1985 Order—
(a) in sub-paragraph (a) for “£0·30” there shall be substituted “£0·50”;
(b) in sub-paragraphs (b) and (e) for “£50”(1) there shall be substituted “£120”;
(c) in sub-paragraph (c) for “£5”(2) there shall be substituted “£15”.

(1) Substituted by S.R. 1998 No. 56 Article 2(a)
(2) Substituted by S.R. 1998 No. 56 Article 2(b)

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/1998/56
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/1998/56

