
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY RULES OF NORTHERN IRELAND

2003 No. 155

The Social Security Benefits Up-
rating Order (Northern Ireland) 2003

PART II
SOCIAL SECURITY BENEFITS AND PENSIONS

Earnings limits

8. In section 80(4) of the Contributions and Benefits Act (earnings limits in respect of child
dependency increases)–

(a) in paragraph (a) for “£155” there shall be substituted “£160”; and
(b) in paragraph (b) for “£155” there shall be substituted “£160” and the sum of £20 remains

the same.


