
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY RULES OF NORTHERN IRELAND

2010 No. 117

The Recovery of Health Services Charges (Amounts)
(Amendment) Regulations (Northern Ireland) 2010

Citation, commencement and interpretation

1.—(1)  These Regulations may be cited as the Recovery of Health Services Charges (Amounts)
(Amendment) Regulations (Northern Ireland) 2010 and shall come into operation on 1st April 2010.

(2)  In these Regulations—
“the principal Regulations” means the Recovery of Health Services Charges (Amounts)
Regulations (Northern Ireland) 2006(1);

Amendment of Regulation 2 of the principal Regulations

2. In regulation 2 of the principal Regulations (amount of health services charges)—
(a) in paragraph (1)(a) for “£171” substitute “£177”;
(b) in paragraph (1)(b)(i) for “£566” substitute “£585”;
(c) in paragraph (1)(b)(ii) for “£695” substitute “£719”; and
(d) in paragraph (4) for “£41,545” substitute “£42,999”.

Saving

3. Notwithstanding regulation 2, the principal Regulations shall continue to have effect in respect
of a certificate relating to an incident which occurred before 1st April 2010 as if the amendments
made by these Regulations had not been made.

Sealed with the Official Seal of the Department of Health, Social Services and Public Safety on
18th March 2010.

(L.S.)
John Deery

A senior officer of the Department of Health,
Social Services and Public Safety

(1) S.R. 2006 No. 507

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2006/507

