
 

 

S T A T U T O R Y  R U L E S  O F  N O R T H E R N  I R E L A N D  

2010 No. 230 

AGRICULTURE 

Agriculture (Student fees) (Amendment) Regulations (Northern 
Ireland) 2010 

Made - - - - 24th June 2010 

Coming into operation - 1st September 2010 

The Department of Agriculture and Rural Development(a), in exercise of the powers conferred by 
sections 5A(1) and (2) of the Agriculture Act (Northern Ireland) 1949(b), makes the following 
Regulations: 

Citation and commencement 

1. These Regulations may be cited as the Agriculture (Student fees) (Amendment) Regulations 
(Northern Ireland) 2010 and shall come into operation on the 1 September 2010. 

Amendment to the Agriculture (Student fees) Regulations (Northern Ireland) 2007 

2. The Agriculture (Student fees) Regulations (Northern Ireland) 2007(c) shall be amended as 
provided by regulations 3 and 4. 

3. In Regulation 4(1)(d) for “£1285” substitute “£1310”. 

4. In Regulation 5(2)(e) for “£640” substitute “£650”. 

Revocations 

5. The Agriculture (Student fees) (Amendment) Regulations (Northern Ireland) 2009(f) are 
revoked. 
 
Sealed with the Official Seal of the Department of Agriculture and Rural Development on 24 June 
2010. 
(L.S.) 
 
 Norman Fulton 
 A senior officer of the 
 Department of Agriculture and Rural Development 

                                                                                                                                            
(a) Formerly  the Department of Agriculture for Northern Ireland; see S.I. 1999/283 (N.I. 1), Art. 3(4) 
(b) 1949 c.2 (N.I.).  Section 5A(1) and (2) was inserted by Article 42(1) of the Education (Northern Ireland) Order 2006 (S.I. 

2006/1915 (N.I. 11)) 
(c) S.R. 2007 No.54 
(d) Regulation 4(1) was amended by S.R. 2009 No.321 
(e) Regulation 5(2) was amended by S.R. 2009 No.321 
(f) S.R. 2009 No.321 



 

 2

EXPLANATORY NOTE 

(This note is not part of the Regulations) 

These Regulations amend the Agriculture (Student fees) Regulations (Northern Ireland) 2007. 
They also revoke the Agriculture (Student fees) (Amendment) Regulations (Northern Ireland) 
2009. 

These Regulations increase the level of fee to be paid by persons undertaking a course of higher 
education provided by the Department of Agriculture and Rural Development as set out in 
Regulations 3 and 4. 
 

£4.00 

Dd. N4452. C2. 6/10. Gp. 130. 14567. 

© Crown Copyright 2010 

Printed in the UK by The Stationery Office Limited under the authority and superintendence of Carol Tullo, Controller of Her Majesty’s Stationery 
Office being the Government Printer for Northern Ireland and the Officer appointed to print the Acts of the Northern Ireland Assembly. 


