
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made).

STATUTORY RULES OF NORTHERN IRELAND

2015 No. 119

The Automatic Enrolment (Earnings Trigger and
Qualifying Earnings Band) Order (Northern Ireland) 2015

Increase of amounts

2. In section 13(1)(1) (qualifying earnings)—
(a) in paragraph (a) for “£5,772” substitute “£5,824”;
(b) in paragraph (b) for “£41,865” substitute “£42,385”.

(1) Section 13(1) was amended by Article 2(2) of S.R. 2014 No. 81

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2014/81

