
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY RULES OF NORTHERN IRELAND

2016 No. 92

The Social Security Benefits Up-
rating Order (Northern Ireland) 2016

State Pension Credit

6. In regulation 6 of the State Pension Credit Regulations (Northern Ireland) 2003(1) (amount
of the guarantee credit)—

(a) in paragraph (1)(a) for “£230∙85” substitute “£237∙55”; and
(b) in paragraph (1)(b) for “£151∙20” substitute “£155∙60”.

(1) S.R. 2003 No. 28; regulation 6(1) was amended by Article 24(2)(a) of S.R. 2015 No. 124

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2003/28
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2015/124

