
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY RULES OF NORTHERN IRELAND

2017 No. 221

The Waste (Fees and Charges) (Amendment)
Regulations (Northern Ireland) 2017

Amendments of the Controlled Waste (Registration of Carriers and Seizure of Vehicles)
Regulations (Northern Ireland) 1999

2.—(1)  The Controlled Waste (Registration of Carriers and Seizure of Vehicles) Regulations
(Northern Ireland) 1999(1) are amended in accordance with paragraph (2)—

(2)  In regulation 4 (applications for registration)—
(a) in paragraph (8)(a) for “£142” substitute “£144”; and
(b) in paragraph (8((b) for “£72” substitute “£73”.

(1) S.R. 1999 No. 362 as amended by S.R. 2011 No. 127, S.R. 2013 No. 248 and S.R. 2015 No. 21S.R. 2016 No. 401

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/1999/362
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2011/127
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2013/248
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2015/21
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2016/401

