
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made).

STATUTORY RULES OF NORTHERN IRELAND

2019 No. 188

The Social Security Benefits Up-rating
(No. 2) Order (Northern Ireland) 2019

PART 2
SOCIAL SECURITY BENEFITS AND PENSIONS

Statutory paternity pay, statutory adoption pay and statutory shared parental pay

10.—(1)  In the Statutory Paternity Pay and Statutory Adoption Pay (Weekly Rates) Regulations
(Northern Ireland) 2002(1)—

(a) in regulation 2(a) (weekly rate of payment of statutory paternity pay) for “£145∙18”
substitute “£148∙68”; and

(b) in regulation 3(a) (weekly rate of payment of statutory adoption pay) for “£145∙18”
substitute “£148∙68”.

(2)  In regulation 40(1)(a) of the Statutory Shared Parental Pay (General) Regulations (Northern
Ireland) 2015(2) (weekly rate of payment of statutory shared parental pay) for “£145∙18” substitute
“£148∙68”.

(1) S.R. 2002 No. 380; relevant amending Rules are S.R. 2004 No. 111 and S.R. 2019 No. 58
(2) S.R. 2015 No. 94; relevant amending Rule is S.R. 2019 No. 58

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2002/380
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2004/111
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2019/58
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2015/94
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2019/58

