
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made).

STATUTORY RULES OF NORTHERN IRELAND

2019 No. 188

The Social Security Benefits Up-rating
(No. 2) Order (Northern Ireland) 2019

PART 2
SOCIAL SECURITY BENEFITS AND PENSIONS

Disability living allowance

14. In regulation 4 of the Social Security (Disability Living Allowance) Regulations (Northern
Ireland) 1992(1) (rate of benefit)—

(a) in paragraph (1)(a) for “£85∙60” substitute “£87∙65”;
(b) in paragraph (1)(b) for “£57∙30” substitute “£58∙70”;
(c) in paragraph (1)(c) for “£22∙65” substitute “£23∙20”;
(d) in paragraph (2)(a) for “£59∙75” substitute “£61∙20”; and
(e) in paragraph (2)(b) for “£22∙65” substitute “£23∙20”.

(1) S.R. 1992 No. 32; regulation 4 was amended by regulation 2(5) of S.R. 1993 No. 340 and Article 14 of S.R. 2019 No. 58

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/1992/32
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/1993/340
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2019/58

