
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY RULES OF NORTHERN IRELAND

2020 No. 98

The Student Fees (Amounts) (Amendment)
Regulations (Northern Ireland) 2020

PART 2
AMENDMENT OF THE STUDENT FEES (AMOUNTS)

REGULATIONS (NORTHERN IRELAND) 2005

Amendment of Student Fees (Amounts) Regulations (Northern Ireland) 2005

2. The Student Fees (Amounts) Regulations (Northern Ireland) 2005(1) shall be amended as
provided by regulations 3 and 4.

3. In regulation 3 (Prescribed basic and higher amounts)—
(a) for “£1,735” substitute “£1,785”; and
(b) for “£4,395” substitute “£4,530”.

4. In regulation 4 (Prescribed basic and higher amounts for specified courses)—
(a) for “£845” substitute “£870”; and
(b) for “£2,185” substitute “£2,250”.

(1) S.R. 2005 No. 290 as amended by S.R. 2006 No. 455, S.R. 2007 No. 442, S.R. 2008 No. 455, S.R. 2009 No. 400, S.R 2011
Nos. 1 and 369, S.R. 2012 No. 184, S.R. 2013 No. 120, S.R. 2014 No. 116, S.R. 2015 No. 243, S.R. 2016 No. 354, S.R. 2017
No. 104, S.R. 2018 No. 105 and S.R. 2019 No. 102.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2005/290
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2006/455
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2007/442
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2008/455
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2009/400
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2011/1
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2011/369
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2012/184
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2013/120
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2014/116
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2015/243
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2016/354
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2017/104
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2017/104
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2018/105
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2019/102

