
Changes to legislation: There are currently no known outstanding effects for the The County
Court (Amendment) Rules (Northern Ireland) 2022, Section 2. (See end of Document for details)

STATUTORY RULES OF NORTHERN IRELAND

2022 No. 233

The County Court (Amendment) Rules (Northern Ireland) 2022

Amendments to the County Court Rules (Northern Ireland) 1981

2. The County Court Rules (Northern Ireland) 1981(1) are amended as follows—
(1)  In Order 26, rule 3(1) for “£3,000” substitute “£5,000”.
(2)  In Order 55, rule 19—

(a) in paragraph (1)(b) for “£3,000” substitute “£5,000”;
(b) in paragraph (2) for “£3,000” substitute “£5,000”.

(3)  In Appendix 1, in Form 10A for “£3,000” substitute “£5,000”.

Commencement Information
I1 Rule 2 in operation at 3.10.2022, see rule 1

(1) S.R. 1981 No. 225, to which the most recent relevant amendments were made by S.R. 2016 No. 302 and S.R. 2011 No. 100.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2022/233/rule/1
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/1981/225
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2016/302
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2011/100


Changes to legislation: 
There are currently no known outstanding effects for the The County Court (Amendment) Rules
(Northern Ireland) 2022, Section 2.


