
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made).

STATUTORY RULES OF NORTHERN IRELAND

2022 No. 46

The Health Protection (Coronavirus, International Travel,
Operator Liability and Information to Passengers)

(Amendment No. 3) Regulations (Northern Ireland) 2022

Correction of the date on which extension of time for requirement to provide passenger
information comes into force

4.—(1)  In regulation 4 of the principal Regulations (requirement to provide passenger
information), in paragraphs (6A)(b) and (7), for “three days” substitute “48 hours”.

(2)  In regulation 4 of the principal Regulations, as amended by paragraph (1), in paragraphs (5),
(6A)(b) and (7), for “48 hours” substitute “three days”.

(3)  Regulation 4 of the Health Protection (Coronavirus, International Travel, Operator Liability
and Information to Passengers) (Amendment No. 2) Regulations (Northern Ireland) 2022(1) is
revoked.

(4)  Regulation 1 sets out different commencement dates for the different paragraphs of this
regulation.

(1) S.R. 2022 No. 43.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2022/43

