Changes to legislation: There are currently no known outstanding effects for the The Waste (Fees and
Charges) (Amendment) Regulations (Northern Ireland) 2023, Section 3. (See end of Document for details)

STATUTORY RULES OF NORTHERN IRELAND

2023 No. 211

The Waste (Fees and Charges) (Amendment)
Regulations (Northern Ireland) 2023

Amendment of the Waste Management Licensing Regulations (Northern Ireland) 2003

3.—(1) The Waste Management Licensing Regulations (Northern Ireland) 2003 (1) are amended
in accordance with paragraph (2).

(2) In Schedule 4 (registration of brokers and dealers of controlled waste)—
(a) Inparagraph 3(10)(a) for “£159” substitute “£164”;
(b) In paragraph 3(10)(b) for “£79” substitute “£82”;
(c) Inparagraph 3(10)(c) for “£41” substitute “£42”.

Commencement Information
n Reg. 3 in operation at 2.1.2024, see reg. 1(1)

(1) S.R.2003 No. 493 the relevant amendments are S.R. 2010 No. 84, S.R. 2011 No. 232, S.R. 2012 No. 112, S.R. 2013 No.248,
S.R. 2015 No. 21, S.R. 2016 No. 401, S.R. 2017 No. 221, S.R. 2018 No. 91, S.R. 2019 No. 83, S.R. 2020 No. 112 and S.R.
2021 No.182, S.R. 2022 No. 127.


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2023/211/regulation/1/1
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2003/493
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2010/84
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2011/232
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2012/112
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2013/248
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2015/21
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2016/401
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2017/221
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2018/91
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2019/83
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2020/112
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2021/182
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2021/182
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2022/127

Changes to legislation:
There are currently no known outstanding effects for the The Waste (Fees and Charges)
(Amendment) Regulations (Northern Ireland) 2023, Section 3.




