
Status: Point in time view as at 10/04/2023. This version of this provision has been superseded.
Changes to legislation: There are currently no known outstanding effects for the The Social Security

Benefits Up-rating Order (NorthernIreland)2023, Section 16. (See end of Document for details)

STATUTORY RULES OF NORTHERN IRELAND

2023 No. 43

The Social Security Benefits Up-
rating Order (NorthernIreland)2023

PART 2
SOCIAL SECURITY BENEFITS AND PENSIONS

Personal independence payment

16. In regulation 24 of the Personal Independence Payment Regulations (Northern Ireland)
2016(1) (rate of personal independence payment)—

(a) in paragraph (1)(a) for “£61.85” substitute “£68.10”;
(b) in paragraph (1)(b) for “£92.40” substitute “£101.75”;
(c) in paragraph (2)(a) for “£24.45” substitute “£26.90”; and
(d) in paragraph (2)(b) for “£64.50” substitute “£71.00”.

Commencement Information
I1 Art. 16 in operation at 10.4.2023, see art. 1(1)(c)

(1) S.R. 2016 No. 217; regulation 24 was amended by Article 15 of S.R. 2023 No. 27

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2023/43/article/1/1/c
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2016/217
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2023/27


Status: 
Point in time view as at 10/04/2023. This version of this provision has been superseded.

Changes to legislation: 
There are currently no known outstanding effects for the The Social Security Benefits Up-rating
Order (NorthernIreland)2023, Section 16.


