Changes to legislation: There are currently no known outstanding effects for the The Universal Credit (Administrative
Earnings Threshold) (Amendment) Regulations (Northern Ireland) 2024, Section 2. (See end of Document for details)

STATUTORY RULES OF NORTHERN IRELAND

2024 No. 107

The Universal Credit (Administrative Earnings Threshold)
(Amendment) Regulations (Northern Ireland) 2024

Amendment of the Universal Credit Regulations

2. In paragraph (14) of regulation 97 of the Universal Credit Regulations (Northern Ireland)
2016(1) (circumstances in which requirements must not be imposed)—

(a) in sub-paragraph (a), for “15 hours” substitute “18 hours”;
(b) in sub-paragraph (b), for “24 hours” substitute “29 hours”.

Commencement Information
n Reg. 2 in operation at 13.5.2024, see reg. 1

(1) S.R.2016/216


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2024/107/regulation/1
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2016/216

Changes to legislation:
There are currently no known outstanding effects for the The Universal Credit (Administrative
Earnings Threshold) (Amendment) Regulations (Northern Ireland) 2024, Section 2.




