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SCHEDULE 6 Regulation 9

BOVINE EMBRYO (COLLECTION, PRODUCTION AND TRANSFER): FEES

Table

Fees payable in connection with activities for the purposes of the 1995 Regulations

Column 1 Activity Column 2 Fee
(£) for applications
received and routine
inspections
commenced before 1
July 2023

Column 3 Fee
(£) for applications
received and routine
inspections
commenced on or
after 1 July 2023

Column 4 Fee
(£) for applications
received and routine
inspections
commenced on or
after 1 July 2024

Time spent by
a veterinary officer
travelling to and from
premises (in this Table
“travelling time”) for
the purpose of the
activities specified in
this column (in
addition to any other
fees specified)

21 per quarter hour or
part quarter hour spent,
up to a maximum of
126

22 per quarter hour or
part quarter hour spent,
up to a maximum of
132

22 per quarter hour or
part quarter hour spent,
up to a maximum of
132

Time (other than
travelling time) spent
by a veterinary
officer carrying out
the activities specified
in this column (in
addition to any other
fees specified)

16 per quarter hour or
part quarter hour spent

22 per quarter hour or
part quarter hour spent

22 per quarter hour or
part quarter hour spent

Considering an
application for
approval of or re-
approval of—

(a) a single bovine
embryo collection or
production team under
regulation 6 or 7 of
the 1995 Regulations
(with or without
an inspection of a
laboratory)

(b) a bovine embryo
transfer team under
regulation 8 of the
1995 Regulations,

28 38 47
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Column 1 Activity Column 2 Fee
(£) for applications
received and routine
inspections
commenced before 1
July 2023

Column 3 Fee
(£) for applications
received and routine
inspections
commenced on or
after 1 July 2023

Column 4 Fee
(£) for applications
received and routine
inspections
commenced on or
after 1 July 2024

(c) a store under
regulation 16 of the
1995 Regulations, or

(d) a store and its
supervisor under
regulations 16 and
19 of the 1995
Regulations.

Considering an
application for
approval of each
additional laboratory or
store from the same
applicant where the
inspection is completed
on the same day

9 13 16

Considering an
application for re-
approval of a
laboratory or a
store following any
alterations

25 34 42

Carrying out a routine
inspection of records of
a single bovine embryo
production, collection
or transfer team, and re-
inspection of a single
laboratory or store

17 23 28

Carrying out a routine
inspection or records of
each additional bovine
embryo production,
collection or transfer
team, and re-inspection
of each additional
laboratory or store.

4 for each additional
team and laboratory or
store

6 for each additional
team and laboratory or
store

7 for each additional
team and laboratory or
store
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