
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

SCOTTISH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2002 No. 235

Act of Sederunt (Fees of Solicitors in
the Sheriff Court) (Amendment) 2002

Amendment of Schedule

2.—(1)  The Schedule to the Act of Sederunt (Fees of Solicitors in the Sheriff Court) (Amendment
and Further Provisions) 1993(1) shall be amended in accordance with the following sub-paragraphs.

(2)  In the General Regulations, in the table in paragraph 14(f)–
(a) in item 1, in the left hand column, for “£50 to £250” there is substituted “£1,000 to £2,500”;
(b) in item 2, in the left hand column, for “£50” there is substituted “£1,000”; and
(c) item 3 is omitted.

(3)  In the Table of Fees, for Chapter IV, Part II (summary causes: defended actions) there is
substituted the Tables of Fees in the Schedule to this Act of Sederunt.

(1) S.I.1993/3080, amended by S.I. 1994/1142, 1995/1395, 1996/236, 1998/2675, S.S.I. 1999/149, S.S.I 2000/420 and S.S.I
2001/438.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1993/3080
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1994/1142
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1995/1395
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1996/236
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1998/2675
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/1999/149
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2000/420
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2001/438

