Changes to legislation: There are currently no known outstanding effects for the The Prisons and
Young Offenders Institutions (Scotland) Rules 2011, Section 41A. (See end of Document for details)

SCOTTISH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2011 No. 331

The Prisons and Young Offenders
Institutions (Scotland) Rules 2011

PART 5
HEALTH AND WELFARE

F1 . . . oy .
[ Accommodation in specified conditions — coronavirus

41A.—(1) For the duration of a coronavirus outbreak, rule 41 has effect subject to the following
modifications.
(2) In sub-paragraph (3)(c), for “72 hours” substitute “14 days”.

(3) In sub-paragraph (12)(a), for “72 hours” substitute “14 days”.]

Textual Amendments
F1  Rule 41A inserted (7.4.2020 at 2.15 p.m.) by The Prisons and Young Offenders Institutions (Scotland)
Amendment Rules 2020 (S.S.1. 2020/122), rules 1, 2(10)


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2011/331/rule/41A
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2020/122
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2020/122
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2020/122/rule/1
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2020/122/rule/2/10

Changes to legislation:
There are currently no known outstanding effects for the The Prisons and Young Offenders
Institutions (Scotland) Rules 2011, Section 41A.




