
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made).

SCOTTISH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2014 No. 35

The Council Tax Reduction (Scotland)
Amendment Regulations 2014

Amendment of the Council Tax Reduction (Scotland) Regulations 2012

3. In regulation 67 (non-dependant deductions)(1)—
(a) in paragraph (1)—

(i) in sub-paragraph (a) for “£10.95” substitute “£11.35”; and
(ii) in sub-paragraph (b) for “£3.65” substitute “£3.75”; and

(b) in paragraph (2)—
(i) in sub-paragraph (a) for “£186.00” substitute “£188.00”;

(ii) in sub-paragraph (b) for—
(aa) “£186.00” substitute “£188.00”;
(bb) “£322.00” substitute “£326.00”; and
(cc) “£7.25” substitute “£7.50”; and

(iii) in sub-paragraph (c) for—
(aa) “£322.00” substitute “£326.00”;
(bb) “£401.00” substitute “£406.00”; and
(cc) “£9.15” substitute “£9.50”.

(1) Regulation 67 is relevantly amended by S.S.I. 2013/48.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2013/48

