Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made).

SCOTTISH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2015 No. 46

The Council Tax Reduction (Scotland)
Amendment Regulations 2015

Amendment of the Council Tax Reduction (Scotland) Regulations 2012

9. In Schedule 1 (applicable amount)(1)—
(a) in the table in paragraph 1 (personal allowances)—
(i) in entry (1)(a) and (b) for “£72.40” substitute “£73.10”;
(1) in entry (1)(c) for “£57.35” substitute “£57.90”;
(iii) in entry (2) for “£72.40” substitute “£73.10”; and
(iv) in entry (3) for “£113.70” substitute “£114.85”;
(b) in the table in paragraph 3 (personal allowances), in entries (a) and (b) for “£66.33”
substitute “£66.90”;
(c) in the table in paragraph 17 (amounts of disability premiums), in the entry—
(1) “Disability premium” for—
(aa) “£31.85” substitute “£32.25”; and
(bb) “£45.40” substitute “£45.95”;
(i1) “Severe disability premium” for—
(aa) “£61.10” on both occasions where it appears substitute “£61.85”’; and
(bb) “£122.20” substitute “£123.70”;
(iii) “Disabled child premium” for “£59.50 substitute “£60.06”;
(iv) “Carer premium” for “£34.20” substitute “£34.60”; and
(v) “Enhanced disability premium” for—
(aa) “£24.08” substitute “£24.43”;
(bb) “£15.55” substitute “£15.75”; and
(cc) “£22.35” substitute “£22.60”;
(d) in paragraph 23 (amount of work-related activity component) for “£28.75” substitute
“£29.05”; and
(e) in paragraph 24 (amount of support component) for “£35.75” substitute “£36.20”.

(1) Schedule 1 is relevantly amended by S.S.I. 2013/48 and S.S.12014/35.


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2013/48
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2014/35

