
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

SCOTTISH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2015 No. 86

The National Health Service (Optical Charges and
Payments) (Scotland) Amendment Regulations 2015

Amendment of the National Health Service (Optical Charges and Payments) (Scotland)
Regulations 1998

4.—(1)  Regulation 19 (redemption value of voucher for replacement or repair) is amended as
follows.

(2)  In paragraph (1)(b), for “£55.80” substitute “£56.40”.
(3)  In paragraph (3)(a), for “£14.40” substitute “£14.60”.
(4)  In paragraph (3)(b), for “£63.00” substitute “£63.60”.


