Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made).

SCOTTISH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2017 No. 41

The Council Tax Reduction (Scotland)
Amendment Regulations 2017

PART 2
Amendment of the Council Tax Reduction (Scotland) Regulations 2012

Amendment of schedule 1

10. In schedule 1 (applicable amount)—
(a) in paragraph 17 (amounts of disability premiums)—
(1) for “£32.25”, substitute “£32.55”;
(ii) for “£45.95”, substitute “£46.40”;
(iii) for “£61.85 in both places where it occurs, substitute “£62.45”;
(iv) for “£123.70”, substitute “£124.90”;
(v) for “£60.06”, substitute “£60.90”;
(vi) for “£34.60”, substitute “£34.95”;
(vii) for “£24.43”, substitute “£24.78”;
(viii) for “£15.75”, substitute “£15.90”; and
(ix) for “£22.60”, substitute “£22.85”; and
(b) in paragraph 24 (amount of the support component), for “£36.20” substitute “£36.55”.



