
Changes to legislation: There are currently no known outstanding effects for the The Council Tax
Reduction (Scotland) Amendment Regulations 2018, Section 16. (See end of Document for details)

SCOTTISH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2018 No. 69

The Council Tax Reduction (Scotland)
Amendment Regulations 2018

PART 3
Amendment of the Council Tax Reduction (State

Pension Credit) (Scotland) Regulations 2012

16. In schedule 1 (applicable amount) M1—
(a) in the table in paragraph 2 (personal allowances) —

(i) in entry (1)(a) for “£159.35” substitute “ £163.00 ”;
(ii) in entry (1)(b) for “£172.55” substitute “ £176.40 ”;

(iii) in entry (2)(a) for “£243.25” substitute “ £248.80 ”;
(iv) in entry (2)(b) for “£258.15” substitute “ £263.80 ”;
(v) in entry (3)(a) for “£243.25” substitute “ £248.80 ”;

(vi) in entry (3)(b) for “£83.90” substitute “ £85.80 ”;
(vii) in entry (4)(a) for “£258.15” substitute “ £263.80 ”; and

(viii) in entry (4)(b) for “£85.60” substitute “ £87.40 ”; and
(b) in the table in paragraph 13 (amount of disability premium)—

(i) in entries (1)(a) and (1)(b)(i) for “£62.45” substitute “ £64.30 ”;
(ii) in entry (1)(b)(ii) for “£124.90” substitute “ £128.60 ”;

(iii) in entry (2) for “£24.78” substitute “ £25.48 ”;
(iv) in entry (3) for “£60.90” substitute “ £62.86 ”; and
(v) in entry (4) for “£34.95” substitute “ £36.00 ”.

Marginal Citations
M1 Schedule 1 is relevantly amended by S.S.I. 2013/49, S.S.I. 2014/35, S.S.I. 2015/46, S.S.I. 2016/81 and

S.S.I. 2017/41.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2018/69/schedule/1
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2013/49
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2014/35
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2015/46
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2016/81
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2017/41


Changes to legislation: 
There are currently no known outstanding effects for the The Council Tax Reduction (Scotland)
Amendment Regulations 2018, Section 16.


