
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

SCOTTISH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2021 No. 431

The Scottish Road Works Commissioner (Imposition
of Penalties) Amendment Regulations 2021

Amendment of the Scottish Road Works Commissioner (Imposition of Penalties)
Regulations 2007

2. The Scottish Road Works Commissioner (Imposition of Penalties) Regulations 2007(1) are
amended as follows—

(a) in regulation 4(2) (level of penalties), for “£50,000” substitute “£100,000”,
(b) in regulation 8(4)(c) (appeals), for “£50,000” substitute “£100,000”.

(1) S.S.I. 2007/411.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2007/411

