Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

SCOTTISH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2022 No. 161

The Council Tax Reduction (Scotland)
Amendment (No. 3) Regulations 2022

Uprating
4. In schedule 1 (applicable amount)—

(a) in paragraph 3 (additional amount in respect of a child or young person who is disabled
where neither the applicant nor the applicant’s partner has an award of universal credit)}—

(i) in sub-paragraph (a) for “£65.94” substitute “£68.04”,
(i1) in sub-paragraph (b) for—

(aa) “£65.94” substitute “£68.04, and

(bb) “£26.67” substitute “£27.44”,

(b) in paragraph 4 (additional amount in respect of a child or young person who is disabled
where the applicant or the applicant’s partner has an award of universal credit}—

(i) in sub-paragraph (a) for “£65.94” substitute “£68.04”,
(i1) in sub-paragraph (b) for—

(aa) “£65.94” substitute “£68.04”, and

(bb) “£26.67” substitute “£27.44”,

(c) inparagraph 4B (additional amount for certain kinship carers in respect of a child or young
person who is disabled) —

(1) in sub-paragraph (a) for “£65.94” substitute “£68.04”, and
(i1) in sub-paragraph (b) for—
(aa) “£65.94 substitute “£68.04”, and
(bb) “£26.67” substitute “£27.44”, and
(d) in paragraph 5(1) (carer premium) for “£37.70” substitute “£38.85”.



