
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

SCOTTISH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2022 No. 169

The National Health Service (Optical Charges
and Payments and General Ophthalmic Services)

(Scotland) Amendment Regulations 2022

Amendment of the National Health Service (Optical Charges and Payments) (Scotland)
Regulations 1998

7. In schedule 3 (prisms, tints, photochromic lenses, small glasses and special frames and
complex appliances)—

(a) in paragraph 1(1)(a) for “£12.60” substitute “£12.85”,
(b) in paragraph 1(1)(b) for “£15.40” substitute “15.70”,
(c) in paragraph 1(1)(c) for “£4.40” substitute “£4.50”,
(d) in paragraph 1(1)(d) for “£4.90” substitute “£5.00”,
(e) in paragraph 1(1)(e)—

(i) in sub-head (i) for “£64.20” substitute “£65.50”,
(ii) in sub-head (ii) for “£57.00” substitute “£58.15”,

(iii) in sub-head (iii) for “£30.80” substitute “£31.40”,
(f) in paragraph 1(1)(g)—

(i) after “hospital eye service),” insert “by an ophthalmic medical practitioner, or by
an optician,”,

(ii) after “certified by the Health Board” insert “, the ophthalmic medical practitioner,
or the optician”,

(iii) for “£64.20”, “£57.00” and “£30.80” substitute “£65.50”, “£58.15” and “£31.40”
respectively,

(g) in paragraph 2(a) for “£14.60” substitute “£14.90”,
(h) in paragraph 2(b) for “£37.40” substitute “£38.15”.


